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( A Report on the Harvard College Curricular Review, 2004, April, pp.63 67

Appendix 4 LIST OF RECOMMENDATIONS )

General Education 

We recommend that the Core Program be succeeded by a general education 

requirement that will enhance curricular choice, educate students in a set of 

areas that are defined broadly, include a wide range of courses, and provide 

for the development of a new set of integrative, foundational courses. 

We recommend that the FAS develop a new set of courses to be known as 

“Harvard College Courses,” that will serve as a central component of a new 

general education requirement. 

We recommend that Harvard College Courses provide one means to fulfill a 

general education requirement. Students should also have the opportunity 

to meet the requirement by selecting courses drawn from departmental and 

other offerings and representing work across broad areas of knowledge. 

We recommend that the Dean, in construction with the Faculty, set out the 

specific criteria for Harvard College Courses, and define the structure of 

requirements for general education. 

We recommend that the international and science components of the general 

education requirement be significantly strengthened. 

We recommend that there be a review of the Expository Writing Program. 

We recommend that concentrations make instruction and feedback on 

written and oral communication an integral part of the concentration 

program. 

We recommend that the language requirement be enhanced as follows: all 

students who meet the language requirement at matriculation under 

present rules will be required to take one term of a foreign language or a 

one-term course taught in a foreign language. 

We recommend that special attention be paid to quantitative skills in the 

definition of the general education requirement and in the criteria for 

Harvard College Courses. 

     We recommend that the Dean convene a working group of science faculty to 

plan the redesign of introductory science courses and to reassess the 
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pre-medical curriculum. 

We recommend that the Dean and the Faculty examine ways in which to 

incorporate the study of ethical and moral questions into the College’s 

general education program. 

Concentration 

We recommend that concentration choice be moved to the end of the first term 

of the sophomore year. 

We recommend that each concentration review its requirements with an eye 

toward reducing them to a level appropriate to a liberal arts and sciences 

education for non-specialists, and that there be a presumptive cap of 12 on 

the number of concentration requirements. 

We recommend that each concentration, or field-specific track within a 

concentration, formulate a single set of requirements for all concentrators, in 

place of the existing basic and honors tracks. 

We recommend the development, where appropriate, of alternative capstone 

experiences to the senior thesis. 

We recommend that all tutorial programs be headed by professional faculty 

with responsibility for the oversight of syllabi and instruction. 

We recommend that all concentrations introduce a junior seminar program of 

faculty-taught, small-group seminars, or otherwise ensure that all 

concentrators enroll in a small course taught by a faculty member. 

We recommend that all concentrations review their requirements to reassess 

the balance between disciplinary focus and opportunities for 

cross-disciplinary work, at both the introductory and advanced levels. 

We recommend that the Head Tutor or Director of Undergraduate Studies in 

each concentration (with a preference for the latter title because of its 

clarity) be a senior faculty member charged with oversight of concentration 

advising and monitoring of students’ academic progress within the 

concentration. 

We recommend that concentrations, particularly the large concentrations, 

increase faculty participation in concentration advising. 

We recommend that each student be assigned a concentration adviser. 

We recommend that students be required to meet with an adviser for a 

substantial discussion at least twice per year. 

We recommend that each concentration ensure that every student who wishes 
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to pursue a senior thesis is matched with a thesis adviser. 

We recommend that each concentration establish an Undergraduate Studies 

Committee, composed of concentrators, to provide systematic feedback and 

suggestions for improvements in the course offerings and structure of the 

concentration. 

We recommend that the Educational Policy Committee engage each 

concentration in a review of its purpose and structure as part of a 

recertification of all concentrations. 

Introduction Students to the College: The First-Year Experience 

We recommend that students no longer be required to meet the foreign 

language requirement in the freshman year. 

We recommend that the FAS continue to expand the Freshman Seminar 

Program with the goal of offering enough seminars to accommodate the 

entire freshman class by academic year 2006-2007. 

We recommend that all freshmen be required to enroll in a small-group, 

faculty-led seminar, such as a Freshman Seminar or its equivalent, in the 

freshman year. 

We recommend that departments in which courses are tracked have clear 

provisions for correcting a student’s placement during the semester. 

We recommend that students be required to take at least two courses during 

the freshman year that are not letter-graded, and be allowed to take up to 

four. 

We recommend that the Dean of Harvard College create an office to coordinate 

all aspects of academic advising. 

We recommend that pre-concentration academic advising be separated from 

proctoring, and that each freshman be assigned to an adviser with related 

academic interests. 

We recommend that the Dean of Harvard College work with departments to 

encourage more faculty to serve as pre-concentration advisers. 

We recommend that the advising office organize a series of dinners for 15 

freshmen with a faculty member, the students and faculty member matched 

by broad areas of academic interest. 

We recommend that, building upon existing procedures by which students 

indicate possible areas of concentration, the concentrations take 

responsibility for sharing important advising information with prospective 
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concentrators. 

We recommend that freshmen be assigned to a House before the start of 

freshman year and be housed together in dormitory entries affiliated with 

their House. 

Expanding Opportunities 

We recommend there be an expectation that all Harvard College students 

pursue a significant international experience during their time in the College, 

and that completion of such an experience be noted on the transcript. 

We recommend that the FAS expand its allocation of financial support, 

including summer grants, salaries, stipends, and loans, in order to make it 

possible for all students to pursue at least one international experience. 

We recommend that the Office of International Programs, in consultation with 

the concentrations, identify study abroad programs in which Harvard 

College students may enroll for degree and concentration credit, and that all 

concentrations plan requirements and course sequences to accommodate one 

term of study abroad. 

We recommend an increase in funding for undergraduates to engage in 

faculty-supervised research projects over the summer. 

We recommend that the College provide to all students comprehensive 

information and advice about faculty-supervised research projects and 

funding sources. 

We recommend that the Dean, working with the President, Provost, and the 

deans of other Faculties, develop policies to reduce the financial and 

administrative barriers that impede faculty from one part of the University 

teaching in another. 

We endorse the proposal of the University Committee on Calendar Reform to 

synchronize the calendars of the several Faculties of the University. 

We recommend the creation of a January term in conjunction with the 

proposed University-wide calendar. 

We recommend that there be an office within Harvard College to work with 

students, faculty, and directors of arts, athletic, and public service programs 

to coordinate and administer a set of offerings in January. 

We recommend that the Dean for the humanities work to expand curricular 

opportunities for performance and the creative arts in Harvard College, and 

that the Faculty be receptive toward proposals for new tracks and new 
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concentrations that focus on the practice and performance of the arts. 

We recommend that the College work with Phillips Brooks House and other 

organizations to assist faculty who would like to include a public service 

component in a course. 

We recommend that sections in courses that include a formal public service 

component normally be limited to 12 students. 

Fostering Pedagogical Improvement and Innovation 

We recommend that resources be developed to increase the number of seminar 

rooms and small classrooms with flexible layouts to facilitate group 

discussion and with appropriate instructional media equipment. 

We recommend that lecture halls be designed to facilitate more interactive 

instruction, and to be equipped to enable the use of the widest range of 

technologies. 

We recommend that the Dean explore the possibility of reducing section size 

from 18 to 15 in those courses large enough to subdivide into two or more 

sections (ordinarily those that enroll more than 22 students). 

We recommend that pedagogical training be required of all new section 

leaders, including instruction in guiding and evaluating student writing and 

oral presentation. 

We recommend that the Graduate School of Arts and Sciences create a new 

fellowship to recognize outstanding teachers. 

We recommend that concentrations and individual courses create more 

opportunities for students to engage in collaborative, small-group work, and 

that support be provided for introducing these opportunities. 

We recommend that courses include several written assignments during the 

term, including at least one graded assignment before mid-semester, so that 

students may calibrate their progress. 

We recommend that all courses be evaluated both at mid-term and at the end 

of the term, and that these evaluations be completed in an online format with 

the ability to customize questions for the specific course. 

We recommend that the Dean of Harvard College more closely coordinate the 

activities of pedagogical support programs. 

- 172 -



Curricular Development within a Research-Intensive 
University : The Example of Harvard 

Dr. James Wilkinson 
(DDirector, Derek Bok Center for Teaching and Learning, Harvard University) 

 (53rd CSHE Seminar, Nagoya University 
December 6, 2005) 

Let me start with a little background. As you know from the handout, 
Harvard has begun a curricular review that is still in progress, it is not 
completed yet by any means. In fact today, were I back at my university I 
would be going to a faculty meeting where they will be voting on some of the 
provisions of the review having to do with student advising. So, it’s a 
complicated process both in terms of the consultations that preceded it and the 
legislation that will come out of it, and the implementation of whatever new 
regulations that are decided on.  

The question is “why do this? Why have a curricular review at all? There are 
several possible answers. One is that it’s useful to revitalize the faculty. In the 
background we should keep the question of the purpose of the review in mind. 
For now let me say it is extremely broad. It takes in how to define liberal 
education, which is a topic under discussion for some 2,000 years as far as I 
can see all the way back to Seneca. Trying to figure out what a liberal 
education is. I remember at a conference a few years ago in Mexico I was 
taken to task by an elderly professor who told me he thought that the concept 
of liberal education was much too ideological, and that in fact there should be 
conservative education as well. I had to tell him that the term came from the 
Roman word for “free men,” and that liberal education was what you needed 
in order to participate in the political life of your city. So, even the term liberal 
education is subject to misinterpretation. 

Harvard is trying to redefine liberal education; it’s very interested in an 
increasing emphasis on science. It’s interested in international experience for 
its students. Changing the academic calendar, and improving students 
advising, and others. Each of these five areas have implications for the others, 
it is in a sense integrated. You can’t change part of the system without having 
the effects ripple through the rest of the institution. The process is on going 
and intricate in the sense that it involves many different moving parts. The 
curricular review is both a process that results in certain outcomes: new 
requirements, new administrative structures. And it will probably take 
another 3 years to put them in place. 

But I will focus more today on the process, because the outcomes aren’t 
entirely clear. Second, I think it may be more interesting to you to think about 
the means through which this review is proceeding. Then, the specifics, which 
in some cases are quite different from the concerns here in Nagoya. But I hope 
that some of the stupid things that Harvard has done in the last 5 years are 
mistakes that others can avoid, so I come here in part as a critic of my own 
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institution. I don’t think Harvard always gets it right, and often Harvard gets 
it wrong. The one thing to say in Harvard’s defense is that it tries a second or 
third time. There is a self-correction mechanism that should be part of any 
curricular review, and certainly the mechanism has been much needed in the 
case of Harvard.  

The question of “why have a curricular review”? One answer is that things 
are not the same in the world since the last review took place, a review which 
I remember very well. I was an assistant professor at the time; I remember 
these debates in the faculty about what should be tried. They were very long 
and tiresome but in the end it was a very healthy process to try to justify what 
Harvard was doing. So, even if nothing changes, it would be important to 
“rehearse” the reasons for requirements for the different departments for the 
shape of the education. But the world changes in 30 years and things like an 
emphasis on science and more international experience are a reflection of 
those changes. We all know the clichés about globalization, technological 
revolutions, etc. But these have a real impact on institutions and even a large, 
wealthy, private institutions such as Harvard is not immune to what happens 
in the rest of the world. If we don’t take account of the changes over the last 
30 years we really aren’t doing our job.  

Second, there is a top-down reason for curricular review. Harvard has a new, 
energetic President, who is not above trying to make things happen his own 
way. There is a new Dean in the Faculty of Arts & Sciences (FAS). So people 
at the top are interested in change, partly just to leave their mark on the 
institution. It’s like moving into a new house and painting it a different color. 
Equally interesting is pressure from below. I’m quoting from the Boston Globe. 
They managed to secure a secret report that compares 30 different colleges 
and universities. It looks at the degree of satisfaction and it turns out Harvard 
has some very unhappy students compare to other schools. The degree of 
satisfaction grew for each year that they were at Harvard, so that the new 
students were the happiest, while those who had been there for 4 years were 
the unhappiest. The dissatisfaction included trying to find faculty, they were 
always in their labs, or in Washington, or on speaking engagements maybe 
even in Japan. They were not too happy with the quality of the courses and 
they were distinctly unhappy with the quality of advising. There are reasons 
inside the university at the top and bottom. There is a sense that the time is 
right to do some self-examination and perhaps change some things. 

Let me say a couple of things about Harvard. One of the surprising things is 
how decentralized it is. It really resembles a kind of feudal kingdom with a 
very weak king and very powerful barons each sitting in their own castles. 
Those barons are the Deans of the 14 separate faculties, each financial 
independent. Harvard’s motto is “every tub on it’s own bottom”. Which means 
each faculty should have responsibility for its own finances. In practice this 
means that there are some very rich faculties like Business or Law, Medicine, 
and poor faculties, in the monetary sense, not in the intellectual sense, such as 
architecture, the divinity, and unfortunately education. Those are the less well 
endowed because their graduates make the least money, and Harvard as a 
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private institution relies on contributions from its alumni to maintain its 
finances.  

The practical implication is that each faculty gets to decide a lot about 
curriculum, requirements, and the FAS of which my Center is a part is the 
largest of the 14. It consumes near 50% of Harvard’s resources. So when I talk 
about Harvard in my remarks, I’m really talking about FAS. This curricular 
review is taking place in the FAS, which is the only faculty with 
undergraduate students. Every other faculty has only graduate degrees. The 
FAS has 800 faculty members, 6,600 undergraduates, 3000 graduate students, 
and many committees. It is self-governing, and that’s why there are all these 
committees. The FAS can make a lot of decisions about what they want to do, 
and although our new President has ambitions to try to influence the faculty, 
he has been humbled recently, so I don’t think he’ll have a great deal of say in 
what the Faculty decides to do. 

The process of curricular review involves a huge amount of time from many 
different people. This is one of the pre-requisites, a necessary but not a 
sufficient condition for success for curricular review—getting the faculty on 
board. One reason it takes a long time is you have many committee meetings, 
and as a member of one of the committees (Committee for Pedagogical 
Improvement) it’s not always fun to sit and talk about the same topic again, or 
listen to the complaints of your colleagues having to do with what was decided 
last month, so this is a process that tests the patience and committee of the 
members of the faculty in order to get the review completed. 

What is the structure of the curriculum? 18,000 students at Harvard, and 
9,000 are at the FAS. These 6,600 students spend 4 years; take 4 courses each 
semester, 2X a year, if they obtain the necessary credits they will qualify for 
the degree. Half of the courses are in a concentration or “major”. When I was 
an undergraduate at Harvard I majored in French History and Literature. 
That’s only half of your courses. One quarter is in general education, and a 
quarter can be chosen as the students wish. Why is it that students don’t take 
all their courses in their special chosen area? I think the short answer is that 
American high schools are very weak in terms of preparation they give to 
students. When students arrive at Harvard, they don’t know as much as 
students who arrive at universities in Japan. In fact they know much, much 
less. We have to try to bring them up to speed by giving them a required 
course in writing English, and in introducing them to a number of different 
subject to broaden their education. In many other countries they would have 
already studied in high school and that would be time saved at the university.  
One reason it takes 4 years and only half of the time is spent in a particular 
field is because there is a lot of remedial work that needs to be done. 

Let me put forward a paradox, which underlies this whole issue of 
curricular reform.  For a review to be successful it has to hang together. There 
has to be a central logic, an animating concept behind the curricular review. 
That is what we might call the philosophical premise for the curricular review. 
But there’s a political premise, that for it to be adopted and implemented it 
has to secure the support from the faculty. You could have the most logical 
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review in the world, if it’s not adopted and implemented, who cares? There’s 
no point in having decided upon it in the first place. 

However, a faculty will open support a new curriculum if it helps them, if it 
is in their interests. And because the faculty are so different, their interests 
are different and potentially in conflict. This means the central logic is also 
impossible, because you can’t get the central logic to embrace all of these 
different faculty opinions. Maybe you can but it takes a very long time and a 
lot of negotiation. Here we have an intellectual imperative for coherence, and 
a political imperative for faculty participation. The faculty need to “buy into” 
this whole program. There is no such thing at Harvard as the curricular police. 
No one will come into your classroom to make sure you are implementing the 
curricular review. So, you could say “yes”, to the curricular review and turn 
around and do whatever you want in your classroom. It’s a little bit like the 
famous Japanese distinction between honne and tatemae. You can be very 
tatemae with your colleagues, but you are going to do with your students as 
you wish.  

A curriculum that succeeds has everyone onboard so the distinction between 
honne and tatemae has collapsed. The two are identical in the ideal curricular 
review. But to do that the faculty has to be won over, you have to listen to 
them. Among other things you have to find out what they are interested in. 
They may not be interested in anything that matters to you, but nevertheless 
you have to somehow get them on board. I know of a number of reviews that 
look great on paper. You think “Wow! This is going to be the new millennium 
in terms of education!” But nothing changes. Because there is no teaching 
police to enforce the changes. Institutions, and particularly universities, have 
a tremendous amount of inertia. They are very conservative. That’s one reason 
that as an institution has survived since the 12th century in Europe or even 
earlier if you count Buddhist universities in Kyoto. Universities was teaching 
institutions have been around for a very long time. They don’t change easily. 
So you could say the whole idea of a curricular review is a bit of a gamble. It’s 
taking on an institution with a lot of inertia, and trying to get it to move.   

So, given this paradox, the question is “what is possible?” And I’ve outline a 
couple of the possibilities. We could have coherence without practical results. 
That’s the fine-sounding review that doesn’t change anything. Or we could 
have practical results that are piecemeal, that is different and maybe even 
conflicting changes. Real change, but without coherence. For instance, you 
could make the students take more science courses as a requirement for the 
bachelor’s degree, but if you also want them to have international experience, 
you reduced the ability of them to have more science courses. You really need 
to think about priorities. Not all things are possible, and putting forward some 
goals for the curricular review may make other ones impossible. There’s just 
not enough time to do everything that you would like.  

Let’s shift focus from the theory of curricular review to the practice. What 
has Harvard done in the last three years? What procedures have it followed. I 
think we can divide is up into four different phases, all of which have one 
thing in common--they all have consultations with the different stakeholder 
groups, the faculty, the administrators, and the students, most importantly 
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being the faculty, because they have the final vote on most of the new 
proposals. But it’s important to say that all groups have a stake in the 
outcome, and when I ask why do we have a curricular review, the 
administrators want to put their stamp on a new Harvard, the students are 
unhappy. The faculty are the least unhappy and are the most content to go 
along as it were, but at the same time they are the most important group to 
win over. So, if we look at the balance between incentives to power, the people 
with the incentive to change, the students have practically no power, the 
administrators have limited power, given how decentralized Harvard is. The 
faculty have the most power and the least incentive.  

Phrase I 

Phase one of the curricular review was to create 4 working groups two years 
ago to look first at the students’ academic experience, including the 
dissatisfaction with the quality of instruction. Looking at pedagogy, that is, 
what are the options for teaching? A lot has changed in terms of pedagogical 
theory and outlook in the last 30 years, at least in the United States. The 
lectures now are seen as a flawed instrument of teaching and so-called active 
learning--small-group learning, problem-based learning-- is much more widely 
supported now than it was 30 years ago, even by faculty. General education is 
this one quarter of the students’ program that has a broad base; the closes we 
could come to is liberal education. Also a focus on concentration, which is one-
half of a student’s program. This is a very broad mandate. The working groups 
are out there exploring. It’s almost like the beginning stages of a research 
project.

Who is involved? The Dean of the FAS appointed people to serve on these 
groups. He appointed 34 junior and senior faculty, (assistant, associate and 
full professors). 12 students, which is very significant and a good idea. The 
students have the most incentive for change, so it was important to hear at 
least what they didn’t like about their courses. 4 administrators who were 
largely drawn from people who had much contact with students. Of course all 
of these people had to agree to serve, so this is a group of people interested in 
education and curricular reform and therefore not very representative of the 
faculty as a whole.  

From this group, a 12-person steering committee shared by the dean, Kirby, 
coordinated the 4 groups. So this was the attempt by Kirby to solve the 
problem of piecemeal reform right at the start. In December 2003, he sent the 
results of this initial group; sending a letter to faculty outlining the themes 
which were the general results of looking into these four different areas. These 
working groups have been in operation for 7 or 8 months. 

What were the themes? Internationalization (globalization, the need for 
Harvard to engage with the world as a whole). Science: the degree of science 
illiteracy among undergraduates was alarming high. The philosophy and 
literature majors were not very strong in any aspect of science, whether it was 
quantitative reasoning or basic knowledge of chemistry or physics, etc. 
Interdisciplinary work was something that felt very important to this 
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beginning working group phase. Disciplinary boundaries are artificial. They 
are creations of academic departments to some degree. Increasingly, 
particularly in the sciences, there are working groups that combine physicists, 
molecular biologists, and chemists. The idea was that disciplinary boundaries 
being artificial should be looked on as something that should be dealt with 
flexibly, and there was not enough flexibility. 

Creating groups of students interested in learning, a nod to pedagogy—the 
pedagogical sub-committee liked communities of learning. They also wanted 
students to be more involved directly in research. These were the two 
recommendations or themes that I felt happiest about. Harvard is finally 
trying to confront 21st century pedagogy. We’ll see what happened to them 
over time.  

Phase II 

Now we come to phrase two. In the spring of 2004, almost 2 years ago, the 
working groups issued their findings; the findings were synthesized into a 
report by an administrator. They came up with fifty-seven different 
requirements. There was little coherence in the 57 recommendations. This is 
called a laundry list. Everything was there. Many of them were reasonable, 
but they weren’t organized into a coherent whole. The real question is what do 
you do with 57 different recommendations. The fist thing was to talk about 
them. The Dean held meetings but the reaction was very negative. People 
didn’t like this document. It was incoherent, superficial and had no central 
logic. The administrator who prepared the report was essentially fired. A new 
series of seven committees were created to repair the damage.  

Here we have a typical procedure in curricular review. It is good to repair 
the damage. Administrators could simply ignore the fact that people don’t like 
the report. The penalty for ignoring that is that faculty will simply sit on their 
hands and do nothing when it comes time to implement the report. The bad 
thing is that they created new committees since that’s not necessarily going to 
solve the problem. 

We’re starting fresh with phase two with seven committees (general 
education, science, internationalization, etc.) A new committee was set up to 
look at the academic calendar. The idea was that Harvard should take the 
month of January and have it be it’s own self-contained unit when students 
could go off and do something interesting. As it is now, students come back 
and prepare for exams, which are held at the end of the month. These 
committees were formed to address the major recommendations in the initial 
review. Their focus was a little tighter. They had a clearer mandate. So that’s 
progress.  

Phase III 

About a year ago the new committees began to see what in the April report 
that they could use. We have more people involved 50 faculty, 13 students, 20 
administrators. Many of them are new. We had faculty burnout on the 

- 178 -



committees. Any community at small universities is staffed by the same group 
of public-spirited people. There are other faculty you wouldn’t want to put on a 
committee. This small group of public-spirited faculty get tired. Some of these 
faculty weren’t happy about coming on board. The report had raised such 
negative feelings. Some faculty were motivated for the first time to be part of 
the process. So that was the upside. By antagonizing the faculty actually the 
process allowed for more recruitment. The one way I can change this is in 
becoming a player.  

With seven committees and no steering committee the big problem was that 
they didn’t talk to each other very much. There were a few people who served 
on more than one committee, and finally, before they started issuing their new 
reports, the chairs of the committees began meeting with together. When the 
reports came out, it was a mixed reaction. It was not as bad as the reaction to 
the April document, but there was one committee (general education) that was 
really trashed. The President of Harvard tried to exercise some pressure over 
this committee in his relations with Dean Kirby were bad. His people’s skills 
were worse. There was no consensus on the general education committee. 
Rather than issue a set of recommendation they said, “Harvard is in favor of 
general education”. This was not one of the prouder moments in the Harvard 
curricular review. Many faculty thought of this as a disaster. I got a call from 
someone at WestPoint who said “I’ve seen a copy of the general education 
committee report. Is that all? I said, “Yes it is all”. That was embarrassing. We 
went back to square one again. 

This summer five members of the general education committee met 
regularly all summer and drafted a new, much better report that was accepted 
by the committee members in September. It had intellectual coherence, 
talking about the reasons for general education and how the requirements 
could be satisfied. At the same time the financial impact of the other 
committees was taken into account by the Dean and they came up with some 
priorities. Curricular review cost money. One of the problems with 57 
recommendations is that they all cost money, you don’t have enough money for 
all 57 so which ones do you do? This past summer a new report which was sort 
of the intellectual heart of the curricular review, a financial assessment.  

Phase Four (current phrase) 

A new committee (educational policy committee-EPC) enters the scene and 
weighed in at the end of November with a report on concentrations, which is 
half of the students’ program devoted to a particular field, like philosophy or 
physics. They wanted to make things more flexible for students. One of the 
things students had complained about was all the rules and regulations and 
requirements. The EPC thought that this complaint was justifiable and there 
should be fewer rules and regulations. As an illustration of how this ties 
together, the faculty meeting today on advising, is a direct response to the 
suggestion that there be fewer rules and regulations. If you don’t have so 
many rules and students are going to make their own choices, who is going to 
help them make the choices. You have to have a better advising system. 
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Students were very unhappy about the lack of good advising. This again 
suggests you have to have changes that proceed in tandem, as a package, 
rather than just one or the other. 

Other reports will be presented to the Faculty all during this year for 
separate votes. Many of the reports probably will be approved in their present 
form. Actually implementation will take another 1 to 3 years, but it may take 
longer.  

What will these changes look like? The first thing is the departments will 
get more power since the core undergraduate program is essentially being 
dismantled. The departments will be able to offer more courses on their own. 
Students will have more flexibility of choice. The core program will be replaced 
by a tri-partite system of humanities, social sciences, and natural sciences 
courses which looks just like the curriculum I had in the 1960’s. One of the 
outcomes of the curricular review is a return to the past. But there is for broad 
foundational courses which is the substitute for the core. We may even get 
new interdisciplinary courses. We certainly are going to get better advising. 
The report to be submitted today really puts the squeeze on faculty. Faculty 
members who do advising are supposed to double in the next three years and 
many other things are being considered. That’s a sign that student 
satisfaction is being taken more seriously. I think it was a real shock to people 
at Harvard which is a self-regarding institution (high opinion of its own 
worth) that students were so unhappy and got more unhappy the longer they 
were there. That was a very salutary correction to Harvard’s imprudent self-
satisfaction. The students are being asked more opinion, students sit on a 
number of committees. 

To conclude, I want to ask the question of what sort of broad lessons can one 
draw from this experience which is after all only one typical research-
intensive institutions. I’ve listed six things that are the take-home lessons.  

1) Change has to happen for a purpose. Research should be used to answer a 
question, not just to write about a topic. A famous British historian Lord 
Ackman said, “We must study problems, not periods”. A curricular review 
should be the answer to problems, so you really have to know why you want to 
change. 

2) The Harvard experience suggests the benefit of early and of multiple 
consultations. I think particularly the students played a very constructive role 
in pushing for change. They convinced the faculty who were the least 
motivated to change that something was wrong by appealing to the faculty’s 
pride. The faculty didn’t want to be associated with an institution whose 
students hated what was going on.  

3) The process is very slow and iterative going back to square one at least 
twice. You put out a proposal, it get shot down, you re-draft it, it gets half-
hearted support, you re-draft it again and put it out and hope that you can get 
better support. This is messy. It doesn’t happen according to a fixed timetable. 
The President got furious when things were slower than he wanted. But 
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slowness and iteration are the price to be paid for reforms that are permanent 
or at least lasting. No reform is permanent but some reforms are more lasting 
than others. The investment in slow reforms pays off afterward in having a 
series of reforms that people can generally support. It permits corrections and 
I think the general education report is a good example of why corrections may 
be needed. 

4) There may be tensions in the committee that they can’t come up with a 
coherent set of recommendations, so you need to come up with a kind of self-
correcting process and the committees need to accept criticism. No committee 
should think of themselves as having the final word. They’re just delegated 
power from their colleagues and they need to answer to their colleagues.  

5) I’m not sure the Harvard curricular review has a central logic even now. It 
has more of one than it did at the beginning. The idea that students need to 
have a number of skills—I have been pushing for a particular kind of central 
logic that is involved with the tools for research an inquiry. I don’t think that’s 
going to happen despite memos to the Dean to make this the cornerstone. But 
I think there is more coherence now and that is limited progress.  

What strikes me is that good curricular development has some of the same 
characteristics as good teaching. The process of getting to where we are now at 
Harvard resembles the pedagogical process we all go through in teaching 
courses. A good course will have clear goals, so we can focus on a limited set of 
things the students have to learn. It has continuous feedback.  

We at the Bok Center encourage faculty to have early feedback from 
students. And also to give students an early indication to how well they are 
doing. The feedback runs in both directions.  

The ability to learn from mistakes. It’s good when students make mistakes 
in a course as that shows them the need for change an improvement. It’s also 
good for faculty to learn from mistakes. One of the things my teaching center 
does is give video feedback to show faculty what they look like when they’re 
lecturing and sometimes they’re surprised.  

High standards. You really should undertake a curricular review assuming 
it’s going to make a positive change for the better. People can sometimes rise 
to high standards that’s one reason you learn from mistakes. Faculty said, 
“This isn’t good enough. We don’t like this.” That’s part of having high 
standards. 

Patience in meeting them. You have to think of this as a long-term process. 
Messing up is normal. Having high standards is good but you’re not going to 
meet them right away. If you try over an over again, in the end you may get 
that elusive balance of having some degree of coherence and faculty 
acceptance of the need for reform and of the particular reforms you’re putting 
through. Whether that will happen at Harvard is still an open question, but 
I’m cautiously optimistic that some of the reforms--advising and the new 
curricular structure will have enough general faculty support to be 
implemented. That’s one reason to have this serious of faculty meetings. 
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There’s a lot of talk back and forth that has helped to bring a number of people 
around.

Q & A 

Q: The core represents the philosophy of education. Is there a wide consensus 
on abandoning the core?  
A: I think there is consensus on two grounds. The original justification for the 
core was that the proliferation of academic fields, you could not require that 
students have content knowledge of many different fields, but you could have 
them understand the methodology that was used in the humanities, sciences, 
etc. In the original document of 1978 Harvard doesn’t want to stress great 
books but it want to look at approaches to knowledge. By 2000, most faculty 
had forgotten about the approaches to knowledge part. There is a natural 
progression where courses revert to content focus. The first consensus was 
that the original philosophy for the core was being ignore and wasn’t working. 
The second consensus was that it was too complicated—there were eleven 
different fields students needed to cover. Some they could cover through their 
concentration, but that still left many others. Not every one was offered each 
semester.  

It was felt to have lost the belief in the methodological underpinnings of the 
core. And the administration of the core had become cumbersome and 
constricting. Because of Harvard’s poor advising it meant that students were 
making bad choices. I think faculty are united in getting rid of the core. There 
is some agreement about interdisciplinary approaches. Humanities faculties 
are talking about combining philosophy and literature. I don’t know how well 
that will translate into actual courses. 

There is also an interest in trying to draw students into a “portal” course 
which will have few prerequisites but very high standards. The life sciences, 
biology, etc. have begun this semester.  Between interdisciplinarity and 
bringing in students with no prerequisites but to give students an intense 
introduction to a particular who field, you have the beginnings of a consensus. 
The flexibility makes it hard to predict with certainty whether there will be 
coherence. I see the curricular review as a reaction of the previous core as any 
new kind of vision. It’s like a pendulum. Things have gotten too bureaucratic 
and now let’s move in the direction of more freedom. The next curricular 
review is probably going to call for more rules and regulations. It’s possible 
that between now and a year from now the general education committee or 
others will come up with a better vision to replace the philosophical conception 
of the core. But right now we’re not there yet.

Q: You mentioned no more core in the future. How about the relationship with 
the requirements for determination of concentration. If you’ll be a chemistry 
major then you need this from the core. If you have more freedom, then what 
is the relationship with the students’ future concentrations?  
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A: (refer to drawing on board) Let’s divide the courses up into two groups. We 
have two systems, the old system and new one. Under the old system 
concentration was 50%. The non-concentration was divided into three. The 
requirements for different concentrations are going to be scaled back slightly. 
There’s no more core, but there’s going to be a tripartite division. (25%) 

 Concentration Non-concentration 
OLD 50%+ Core: 25% Free: 25% 
NEW 45% 1) Humanities 

2) Social 
Sciences 
3) Sciences 

Free: 25% 

Suppose you’re studying philosophy means that you will be only studying social 
sciences and natural sciences in the core. One of these three will be eliminated. How 
do you define this group here (humanities)? Previously students of some majors 
wanted to take humanities courses (Japanese art) and apply them to their core, but 
they couldn’t if it wasn’t officially a core course. That didn’t make much sense. Now 
anything counts: department courses. What matters is not who offers the course what 
matters is what is the course about. If you figure that you have 8 half courses you’re 
going to have to take, for a philosophy major, 4 of would be in the social sciences and 
4 in the natural sciences. Any 4 courses that fall into any of the sciences would work. 
You could take 4 in chemistry and really learn something about, or you could take 
different sciences courses. This is why advising is so important. 

Languages are pedagogically interesting. Most foreign languages have a learning 
curve where they have take off in the third year. This is a well-researched area. The 
obvious result is that it’s stupid not to require that student take 3 years of a foreign 
language. The advising is going to be key to convincing students to take more 
foreign language. Here is an example where research in pedagogy can have an 
affect on advising. We’re trusting students to make lots of good decisions.  

Q: You talked about expanding students’ research? There’s a difference 
between Japan and U.S. in Japan. Students have to have a research credit.  
A: It depends on some degree whether you do honors or non-honors. Harvard 
has 2 degrees. A research paper is required for honors (except for chemistry). 
There are other kinds of research you can do: summertime, etc. We would like 
there to be more research that students do. That is going to happen. It was 
one of the original themes of the student group and it’s now kind of 
disappeared. They may be implemented but probably not as a central part of 
the curricular review. You can get an independent study. The student could to 
a directed tutorial with a professor. The student could do research with a 
professor for the whole semester. It would count as a real cost. They’d get a 
grade for it. Just as a graduate student could do research.  

Harvard medical school and life sciences are in close cooperation, and there 
are undergraduates who do research at the medical school. They are part of 
research teams there. Having a lot of research going on in the Boston area is 
something undergraduates should be allowed to take more advantage of.   
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Q: Student dissatisfaction and curricular reform. How are student evaluations 
of courses used? 
A: There’s all sort of research and surveys made of course evaluations. 
Harvard courses (92%) are evaluated and those evaluations are made public. 
They are published in a book and also online. The evaluation is on a 5-point 
scale. I did a study a year ago and discovered that like grade inflation the 
student evaluation had risen by half a point on the 5-point scale since the mid-
70s. Students appeared to be more satisfied. An opposite set of indicators come 
from seniors who are surveyed at the end of senior year. They are very 
unhappy. So we have contradictory data. 3.0 on a 5-point scale is a terrible 
grade. There are very few courses that are rated that low. What explains the 
discrepancy?  

Part of it has to do with how the questions are framed. “Are you satisfied 
with the academic experience” is the question asked of seniors. “Are you 
satisfied with this course” is the course evaluation question. So it’s as if 
students are fairly happy with individual experiences but don’t feel they add 
up to anything. The way the senior satisfaction data is evaluation is against 
other institutions. Which is not the case with individual courses. There are 30 
institutions that Harvard shares data with and it is in these comparisons 
where Harvard is way down. It points out that students are dissatisfied in a 
relative sense vis a vis institutions Harvard compares itself too. The 
comparative data finally drove this forward. You have to think about how the 
question affects the answer and how I’m looking at the data, the difference 
between absolute and relative. We did a study at Harvard on 
underachievement. One group that underachieves is the top quartile. They are 
only the best compared to the other 3 quarters, compared to what they could 
achieve if they were pushed harder. Any measurement depend on a standard. 
The other thing is that another standard/survey took a very small sample 
showed that students were getting progressively less happy.  

Q: Reform efforts for advising and the state of faculty development.  
A: I think it’s in flux. I’m optimistic because faculty are understanding that 
the only way this curricular reform is going to work is if advising improves. It 
may take ten years to get to a really robust advising system. FD component in 
this is huge and it involves many things you wouldn’t normally think of:  
stereotyping. If you’re advising a female student who says, “I want to be a 
chemistry major” you better take her seriously. If you have stereotypes about 
who should major in what you make not take students seriously. Gender 
sensitive/bias components to advising.  

We’re trying to work with faculty and graduate students to help them 
identify what their blind spots are. We have a psychologist on the faculty 
whose don experiments on unintentional blindness. Faculty can be very 
focused on some things and completely miss other things. Harvard has a very 
diverse student body. Which means that when you’re advising you’re likely to 
be advising people who are very different from you. It may be difficult to 
empathize and connect with what they want to do. When you’re talking about 
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faculty development and advising you’re talking about a huge set of attitudes 
that need to be made explicit. Even if faculty were convinced that advising is 
the most important thing, they would still have a long way to go to become 
tuned into not just to people who are different from them but people who are 
20 years old. Advising is central to a well-functioning university and 
incredibly challenging thing for anybody.  

Q: How do you get faculty involved in faculty development? 
A: (normal distribution curve) 3 segments of faculty. These are the faculty you 
want to get involved. What you want them to do is move under the bell. These 
people will respond to volunteers. You need to find allies and pick 
departments and segment the population. It’s a subset of any kind of faculty 
development: syllabus development, course design, advising, etc. The single 
most frequently asked question is “how do we get the faculty involved?” This is 
an international problem. We’ve created a wonderful university that has this 
perverse outcome. We disassociate faculty from pressures and incentives 
required to make them good teachers and good university citizens.  

Q: My question also is about the changes in the core curriculum. I think might 
be interested if you make a comparative study with what is happening in 
Japan and at Harvard prior to 1991 university students spend their first 2 
years learning general education in the three areas. Since 1991 
Monbukagakusho asked universities to abolish the distinction between 
general education and professional education (concentration) programs. 
Students were encouraged to take courses during the 4 years without any 
different between these two areas. Is there any change in the arrangement of 
these three types of courses (humanities/social/sciences)? How significantly 
has the education program changed in terms of faculty members?  
A: The sequence: when would you do the succession to the core. The bachelor’s 
degree in the US is not enough. If you want a law degree you need three more 
years, etc. When students have this concentration, it’s a focus but it’s not 
necessarily what they’ll do the rest of their lives. They can change their minds.  

As for the sequence—it’s mixed. You can take one of these courses senior 
year if you want to. Students often take more of them in the first couple years 
but there’s no require sequence. If you change the label does that change the 
substance. One thing does change. Faculty can be much more excited about a 
course that they have reconceptualized, rethought, etc. It may seem silly to go 
to these efforts to get faculty to re-tool a bunch of courses. I taught at Harvard 
since 1974. When the core came in, people said “Great. Let’s try a new course.” 
There were new courses and some were successful. One thing you get with a 
new label is the incentive to try out something new. In general, anything you 
can do to up the incentive for teaching is a good thing. As long as the faculty 
sit down and tries something else instead of reading from the same notes or 
Power Point slides they’ve used for the last 8 years, they have a reason to do 
something new. That may induce them to create something terrific. If only 30-
40 do that out of 800. You get economies of scale. I understand why you’re 
skeptical.  
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Q: It’s difficult in Japan and other countries to provide new programs in 
limited time. If you have no fundamental changes in faculty members. Even if 
you have new perspectives. You can’t make radical changes overnight. I 
wonder if there are any change in professional education programs? 
A: Yes, but I think they are more pedagogical and less content related. There 
are new specialties but the main change is a shift away from what some 
people have called “just in case teaching” to “just in time teaching.” Just in 
case teaching students memorize huge amounts of information. Just in time 
teaching means you’re given a problem to solve. You go out and do the 
research to solve the problem. (Harvard New Pathways Program). There is the 
attempt in the professional schools to make problem solving more central. It’s 
like the case method widely used in law and business schools. The substance 
doesn’t change so much but the real breakthroughs over the last decade have 
been in the delivery or the pedagogical level.  

Q: I’m interested in how you came up with the theme of internationalization. I 
think it’s kind of a universal general thing around the world in the context of 
higher education research. It’s encouraging to me that Harvard also thinks it’s 
important. What do you exactly mean by internationalization? Do you also 
include fostering intercultural/transnational competence among students? In 
the phrase two the committee name changed slightly to “Committee on 
international studies” which has a different meaning. Were there changes in 
perspectives? 
A: Harvard in some cases isn’t an international place. Up to 10% of the 
undergraduates are not American nationality. More graduate students are 
international students. It’s not bringing more of the world to Harvard, it’s 
really sending Harvard students out. That can happen in study abroad or in 
the community.
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For a century the College of the University of Chicago has been a innovative leader in 

liberal education in the United States. Since the 1930s the curriculum of the College 

has varied in its details, but its intellectual foundations have been constant. 

Undergraduate education at Chicago begins with a common core curriculum, 

conducted from the standpoint of multiple disciplines but beholden to none, which 

provides opportunities for critical inquiry and the discovery of knowledge. Chicago’s 

longstanding commitment to a rigorous core of general education for first- and 

second-year students emphasizes the unique value of studying original texts and of 

formulating original problems based on the study of those texts. The objective of our 

faculty-taught general education courses – which constitute the major component of the 

first two years in the College – is not to transfer information, but to raise fundamental 

questions and to encourage those habits of mind and those critical, analytical, and 

writing skills that are most urgent to a well-informed member of civil society. 

Just as general education provides a foundation for addressing key intellectual 

questions, the major program of study insists upon depth of knowledge and 

sophistication in a defined field – whether a traditional academic discipline, an 

interdisciplinary program, or, in unusual cases, a program of the student’s own design 

undertaken in conjunction with a tutor. Majors afford students invaluable opportunities 

to develop and defend complex arguments by means of extended scholarly research. 

Liberal education does not, however, end with the core and the major. The faculty has 

always believed that maturity and independence of mind are enhanced by exploration 

in intellectual universes outside or transcending required programs of study. Electives – 

that is, courses drawn from other majors, independent research projects, programs of 

overseas study, and advanced training in a second language – provide a breath and a 

balance that is critical to a true liberal education. Hence the Chicago curriculum allows 

up to one-third of a student’s academic work to consist of electives that will build upon 

the work of our general-education courses, but do so on more advanced and more 

focused levels. 

Many national figures in higher education have been identified with Chicago’s 

undergraduate curriculum – including William Rainey Harper, Robert Maynard 

Hutchins, and Edward Levi – but learning at Chicago has never been the province of 

one person or one vision. Rather, the curriculum devoted to “the knowledge most worth 

having,” and the critical cast of mind that it develops, has been the product of 
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generations of collegial debate and constant re-examination, processes which are 

themselves a part of the intellectual adventure to which the curriculum is devoted. 

http://collegecatalog.uchicago.edu/liberal/index.shtml 06/03/22
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Core Program Guide 

http://www.courses.fas.harvard.edu/~core/redbook.html 

Core Curriculum Home  

http://www.courses.fas.harvard.edu/~core/index.html 

Foreign Cultures

http://www.registrar.fas.harvard.edu/Courses/Core/ForeignCultures.html 

Historical Study A B
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http://www.registrar.fas.harvard.edu/Courses/Core/SocialAnalysis.html 

The University of Chicago 

Courses & Program of Study 2004-2006 The College of the University of Chicago 

http://collegecatalog.uchicago.edu/liberal/index.shtml (2006/03/16) 

Courses & Program of Study 2004-2006 The College of the University of Chicago 

http://collegecatalog.uchicago.edu/liberal.shtml (2006/03/16) 
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